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----- Pesan yang Diteruskan -—--

Dari: WICC WICC <editorijicc123@gmail com=
Kepada: Sutarti Tarti <sutarti_stiek@yahoo.com>
Terkirim: Sabtu, 21 September 2019 23.17.27 WIB
Judul: Re: Submit paper Sutarti et al., Mediating role

Dear Authors

We have received your paper and it is now in the initial screening. After the initial screening editor
will decide either paper can go for blind review. Once the paper passed from the blind review than
only we will send you the letter of acceptance.

Please note that the APC of this journal is USD 700. The charges are to cover the editing,
proofreading and formatting cost.

If you have any question or quires do not hesitate to contact us.

Regards
Team UICC

On Sat, Sep 21, 2019 at 4:57 PM Sutarti Tarti <gutarti_stiek{@yahoo.com> wrote:
To Dr. Muhammad Haseeb

Here, we submit an article titled “Mediating Role of Adoption of E-Banking Technology Innovation
BetweenTop Management Team Diversity and Performance: Evidence from Commercial Banks in
Indonesia” for consideration for publication in International Journal of Innovation, Creativity. This
manuscript describes original work and is not under consideration by any other journal. All authors
approved the manuscript and this submission.
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----- Pesan yang Diteruskan -----

Dari: WICC WICC <editor.ijicc123@gmail.com>
Kepada: Sutarti Tarti <sutarti_stiek@yahoo.com=>
Terkirim: Selasa, 1 Oktober 2019 15.38.34 WIB

Judul: Re: Submit paper Sutarti et al., Mediating role

Dear authors,

It's my pleasure to inform you that, after the peer review, your paper, "Mediating Role of
Adoption of E-Banking Technology Innovation Between Top Management Team Diversity and
Performance: Ewidence from Commercial Banks in Indonesia” has been ACCEPTED to
publish with International Journal of Innovation, Creativity and Change, ISSN: 2201-1315/E-
ISSN: 2201-1323. Your article will be published in December, 2019 issue.

There is USD 700 publication fee of article. The publication fee will include the followings.

Article process fee

Article formatting fee that includes the figures and tables adjustment
Expert Opinion, if required

Make it according to the journals requirement

Reference correction, if required

[ B o B R o K R S

Translation of sentences if required

Please find in attachment acceptance letter and invoice. | believe that our collaboration will
help to accelerate the global knowledge creation and sharing one step further. Intellectual

Edge Consultancy SDN Bhd now waiting your article fee in order to process.

Please do not hesitate to contact me if you have any further questions,

Thanks
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Loh Wei-Lyn

Editorial Assistant

International Journal of Innovation, Creativity and Change
ISSN:2201-1315/E-155N:2201-1323

Scopus Indexation url: https:fwww.scopus.com/sourceid/21100819610
Intellectual Edge Consultancy SDN Bhd

B2-1802, TTOI Adina Jalan Judo 13/45

Shah Alam 40100 Selangor
Malaysia
Tel: +801162213388

E-mazil: editor.ijice 123 amail.com
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----- Pesan yang Diteruskan -—---

Dari: International Journal of Innovation, Creativity and Change <aditor@ijicc.nat>
Kepada: Sutarti Tarti <sutarti_stiek@yahoo.com>

Terkirim: Rabu, 25 Maret 2020 07.35.34 WIB

Judul: RE: A letter requesting confirmation of paper improvement

Hi Sutarti,

Thank you for brining the errors to our attention. After examining the published
article, we believe that the incorrect version of your paper was published by mistake.

We apologise for this error. We are happy to substitute your revised copy of the
article.

Sorry for any inconvenience caused.

Reqgards,
The JICC Support Team

Editor's Office
International Journal of Innovation, Creativity and Change

WWWw_jjicc.net

International Journal of
Innovation, Creativity and Change
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From: Sutarti Tari
Sent: Wednesday, 25 March 2020 11:18 AM

To: editor@ijicc.net
Subject: A letter requesting confirmation of paper improvement

To the Management Team

International Journal of Innovation, Creativity and Change

Thank you for publishing our paper in the International Journal of Innovation, Creativity and Change
in volume 9 issue 10 as the link: https:/fwww ijice.netfimages/vol9iss10/91011
Sutarti 2019 _E_R.pdf. (Attached)

But after we read again, in the paper there are still some errors in the use of language. The example
on page 265 still shows where the Indonesian word is used.

We would like to know whether itis possible for the management team to substitute the PDF file that
has been uploaded with the revised PDF file. Because these errors indicate the quality of our paper
iz not excellent.

As a material for improvement and consideration, we are attaching the following published paper and
revised paper which has been adjusted to the format and page number as POF file uploaded in the
IICC journal.

We sincerely hope that this request will be granted. If there are any additional costs required for us to
revise the paper, please submit.

Thank you for your attention.
Best regards,

Sutarti



PAYMENT INVOICE

Invoice# 1JICC_1008.B_2019

Date: September 27, 2019

Sutarti, Akhmad Syakhroza
Vera Diyanty
Setio Anggoro Dewo

Qty Description Total

1

Journal Name: International Journal of Innovation, Creativity and Change
(NICC)
Title: Mediating Role of Adoption of E-Banking Technology Innovation sp 700

Between Top Management Team Diversity and Performance:Evidence
from Commercial Banks in Indonesia

Bank Charges UsD 0.00
Total (USD) USD 700
IDR 9,950,000



Purpose of Payment: Publication Fee (Should Mention)
You can choose any one from the following payment option.

1. PayPal
If you are willing to pay through PayPal, please pay to the following email: intellectual.edgel@gmail.com

2. Malaysia Account

Bank Account Information in Order to pay the process Fee Beneficiary's Name: Intellectual Edge Consultancy SDN
Bhd

Contact No. +60-172957409
Bank Name Address: AFFIN ISLAMIC BANK BERHAD, MSU Shah Alam Business Centre, 2nd Floor University
Drive, Off Persiaran Olahraga, 40100 Shah Alam, Selangor Malaysia

Beneficiary's Account No: 106640006258
SWIFT CODE: AIBBMYKL
Beneficiary's Address: B2-1902, TTDI Adina Jalan Judo 13/45 Shah Alam 40100 Selangor Malaysia

Note: Please put the invoice # as a payment reference

3. Indonesian Account

Account Holder Name: Nira Hariyatie

Bank Name: CIMB NIAGA

Branch: Cabang Banjarmasin-Ahmad Yani Km 2.5
Account Number: 761911987600
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Creativity and Change

(Print) ISSN 2201-1315
pa—— (Online) ISSN 2201-1323

Publishing Group

07 International Journal of Innovation,

Date: 27Sep 2019
Ref.: Regular_ December- 2019_008

Dear authors,

Sutarti, Akhmad Syakhroza
Vera Diyanty
Setio Anggoro Dewo
Department of Accounting, Faculty of Economics
and Business, Universitas Indonesia, Indonesia

It's my pleasure to inform you that, after the peer review, your paper “

” has been ACCEPTED to publish in our journal namely International Journal of
Innovation, Creativity and Change, ISSN: 2201-1315. It will be published in the Regular Issue of December 2019. You
will need to pay the publication fee within 3 working days. | believe that our collaboration will help to accelerate the
global knowledge creation and sharing one step further. Please do not hesitate to contact me if you have any further

questions.

Sincerely,

Aolocker

Managing Editor
International Journal of Innovation, Creativity and Change

International Journal of
Innovation, Creativity and...
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Humanities
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